
$335,000 - 5302 Remington Drive, Harlingen
MLS® #29766606 

$335,000
4 Bedroom, 4.00 Bathroom, 2,878 sqft
Residential on 0.32 Acres

Remington, Harlingen, TX

PRICED TO SELL! BELOW MARKET VALUE!
Meticulously maintained 4-bedroom, 4-bath
custom home on a spacious corner lot at the
end of a quiet cul-de-sac in the prestigious
Remington Estates. Features include a custom
kitchen with rich wood cabinetry, granite
countertops, a center island with gas cooktop,
and stainless steel appliances. The oversized
master suite offers decorative ceilings, a
spa-style bath with Jacuzzi tub, dual vanities,
and a walk-around closet. The versatile fourth
bedroom includes a private bath and attic
access, ideal as a game room, teen suite, man
cave, or guest quarters. Additional highlights
include a formal dining room, cozy breakfast
nook, dedicated office, and a fenced backyard
with the option to expand by moving the fence.
This well-appointed home combines comfort,
style, and functionality in a sought-after gated
community with convenient access to schools
and shopping. A perfect blend of space, style,
and locationâ€”make this home yours!

Built in 2005

Essential Information

MLS® # 29766606

Price $335,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 4.00

Full Baths 4

Square Footage 2,878



Acres 0.32

Year Built 2005

Type Residential

Sub-Type House

Status Active

Community Information

Address 5302 Remington Drive

Area Harlingen

Subdivision Remington

City Harlingen

County Cameron

State TX

Zip Code 78552

Amenities

Amenities Gated Entrance, Homeowners Association

Features None

Parking Spaces 2

Garages Two Cars

Pool None

Interior

Interior Carpet, Ceramic Tile, Hardwood

Interior Features Bonus Room, Ceiling Fans, Other Walk-in Closet(s)

Appliances Disposal, Cooktop-Gas, Single Oven, Standard Refrigerator

Heating Central, Electric

Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Stucco

Exterior Features Covered Patio, Patio Slab, Sprinkler System

Lot Description Corner Lot, Cul-de-Sac Lot

Roof Partial Window Coverings, Other Window Coverings

Foundation Slab

School Information

District HARLINGEN C.I.S.D.

Elementary Stuart



Middle Vela

High Harlingen

Listing Details

Listing Agent Maggie Harris

Listing Office KELLER WILLIAMS REALTY RIO GRANDE VALLEY
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