
$609,000 - 2513 Haverford Blvd, Harlingen
MLS® #29769105 

$609,000
4 Bedroom, 3.50 Bathroom, 3,312 sqft
Residential on 0.31 Acres

Morning Dove Estates, Harlingen, TX

Beautiful 4-Bedroom Home in Harlingen! This
impressive residence offers 4 bedrooms, 3.5
bathrooms, and a thoughtfully designed
open-concept layout that combines comfort
and style. The spacious kitchen features an
island breakfast bar, pantry, and included
appliances, making it ideal for both everyday
living and entertaining. High ceilings enhance
the living area, creating a bright and inviting
atmosphere throughout. The primary suite,
located on the main level, offers a relaxing
retreat with a double vanity, walk-in closet,
garden tub, and separate shower. Additional
spaces include an office or optional second
living area, providing flexibility for your lifestyle
needs. Enjoy a spacious fenced backyard
perfect for outdoor gatherings. The home also
includes under-stair storage accessible
through the garage and showcases custom
finishes and attention to detail throughout.
Conveniently situated just minutes from
Harlingen's premier shopping, schools, and
expressway. A Must See!

Built in 2023

Essential Information

MLS® # 29769105

Price $609,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.50

Full Baths 3



Half Baths 1

Square Footage 3,312

Acres 0.31

Year Built 2023

Type Residential

Sub-Type House

Status Active

Community Information

Address 2513 Haverford Blvd

Area Harlingen

Subdivision Morning Dove Estates

City Harlingen

County Cameron

State TX

Zip Code 78552

Amenities

Amenities No Special Amenities

Features Video Surveillance

Garages Two Cars

Pool None

Interior

Interior Ceramic Tile

Interior Features Bonus Room, Built-ins, Decorative/High Ceilings, Ceiling Fans,
Office/Study

Appliances Microwave Oven, Single Oven, Standard Refrigerator, Cooktop-Electric

Heating Central

Stories 2

Exterior

Exterior Board & Batten Siding

Exterior Features Other-See Remarks

Lot Description Curb & Gutter

Roof Mini Blinds

Foundation Slab

School Information



District HARLINGEN C.I.S.D.

Elementary Lamar

Middle Vela

High Harlingen South

Listing Details

Listing Agent Jaime Lee Gonzalez

Listing Office KELLER WILLIAMS REALTY RIO GRANDE VALLEY

Listing information provided by Rio Grande Valley MLS. IDX Information is provided exclusively for consumers' personal,
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